



PURCHASING DEPARTMENT

135 Van Ness Avenue, Room 123
San Francisco, Ca. 94102

T 415.241.6468
F 415.241.6487

WWW.SFUSD.EDU

INTENT TO AWARD

(Posted: 02/25/2011)

CISCO NETWORK HARDWARE IFB

IFB No. 012-22001179-11

All interested parties are advised that the San Francisco Unified School District, Purchasing Department has completed the evaluation for the Cisco Network Hardware invitation for bid (IFB) and intends to award the bid to Network Hardware Resale.

AWARD

**Network Hardware Resale
26 Castilian Drive, Suite A
Santa Barbara, CA 93117**

We thank you for your interest in bidding on the invitation for bid and look forward to a productive working relationship with the successful bidder.

Bidder	Sub-Total	Sales Tax (9.50%)	Freight	Other	Terms	Bid Total (**)**
Network Hardware Resale	\$ 92,670.00	\$ 8,803.65	Included	\$ -	Net 30	\$ 101,473.65
Shoreline Networks	\$ 98,850.00	\$ 9,390.75	\$ 100.00	\$ -	Net 30	\$ 108,340.75
New Tech Solutions	\$ 124,522.30	\$ 11,829.62	Included	\$ -	Net 30	\$ 136,351.92
Bear Data Solutions, Inc	\$ 140,985.00	\$ 13,393.58	\$ 500.00	\$ -	Net 30	\$ 154,878.58
GOV-Connection	\$ 147,137.96	\$ 13,978.11	Included	\$ -	Net 30	\$ 161,116.07
CDW-G	\$ -			\$ -	Net 30	NO-BID
Allied Network Solutions (ANS)	\$ -			\$ -	Net 30	NO-BID
PC Mall Gov, Inc.	\$ -			\$ -	Net 30	NO-BID
Digital Warehouse	\$ -			\$ -	Net 30	NO-BID
Digital Warehouse	\$ -			\$ -	Net 30	NO-BID

Purchasing Department
San Francisco Unified School District