



INTENT TO AWARD

Posted 04/22/2013

**CISCO HARDWARE 2013 SUMMARY
IFB NO. 013-1613-013F**

ISSUE DATE: 4/2/2013
IFB NUMBER: 013-1613-013F
DUE DATE: 4/12/2013
PURCHASER: Richard Neipling

Bidder	Sub-Total	Freight	Sales Tax 8.75%	Terms	Bid Total (*/**)
CDW Government LLC	\$ 154,887.60	\$ -	\$ 13,552.67	NET30	\$ 168,440.27
New Tech Solutions	\$ 155,436.74	\$ -	\$ 13,600.71	NET30	\$ 169,037.45
En Pointe Technologies	\$ 193,415.44	\$ -	\$ 16,923.85	NET30	\$ 210,339.29
Net Experts, Inc	\$ 194,845.48	\$ 100.00	\$ 17,048.98	NET30	\$ 211,994.46
MSN Corporation	\$ 196,044.76	\$ -	\$ 17,153.92	NET30	\$ 213,198.68
Leverage Information Systems	\$ 196,806.51	\$ -	\$ 17,220.57	NET30	\$ 214,027.08
NWN Corporation	\$ 215,421.28	\$ -	\$ 18,849.36	NET30	\$ 234,270.64
Business Services	\$ 353,049.10	\$ -	\$ 30,891.80	NET10	\$ 383,940.90
Aprisa Technology LLC	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -		NC
Fusion Storm	NO-BID		\$ -		NO-BID
General Datatch LP	NO-BID		\$ -		NO-BID
Softchoice Corporation	NO-BID		\$ -		NO-BID
Computer Sciences Corporation	NO-BID		\$ -		NO-BID

Comments:

Aprisa Technology LLC is non-compliant. Sales Tax applied, 8.75% to all sub-total amounts. The sales tax may affect the net amount (+/-) due to Californain tax software license use tax regulations.

* NB = No Bid

** NC = Non-Compliant

Thank you for participating.

San Francisco Unified School District (SFUSD)
Purchasing Department
135 Van Ness Avenue
San Francisco, CA. 94102